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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Yvette, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Dan and Amie, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear John, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Bubba and Gram, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Mama, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Grandpa Don and Mary Alice, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Joe and Cheryl, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Jared, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Val, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Brad and Katie, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Rob and Jaime, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Evelyn, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Stephen and Amanda, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Kelly, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Jeff and Carolyn, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Sam and Lesley, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  



	
	

 
 
	
	

	

Funtkova ulica 32 | 1000 Ljubljana, Slovenia | Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org | Niki.Shirkman@cru.org | 330-608-9756	
	

Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Carol, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Aron and Rachel, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Josh and Meg, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Brian and Brooke, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Dylan and Joy, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Friends, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  



	
	

 
 
	
	

	

Funtkova ulica 32 | 1000 Ljubljana, Slovenia | Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org | Niki.Shirkman@cru.org | 330-608-9756	
	

Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Joshua and Elyse, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Gary, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Jared and Ashley, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Mitch and Shannon, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Friends at Cornerstone, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Adam and Brittany, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Jay and Janice, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear BJ and Katy, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Susan, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  



	
	

 
 
	
	

	

Funtkova ulica 32 | 1000 Ljubljana, Slovenia | Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org | Niki.Shirkman@cru.org | 330-608-9756	
	

Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Jared and Sam, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Caleb and Michaella, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  



	
	

 
 
	
	

	

Funtkova ulica 32 | 1000 Ljubljana, Slovenia | Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org | Niki.Shirkman@cru.org | 330-608-9756	
	

Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Marcille, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Andy and Colleen, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Dan and Kim, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  



	
	

 
 
	
	

	

Funtkova ulica 32 | 1000 Ljubljana, Slovenia | Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org | Niki.Shirkman@cru.org | 330-608-9756	
	

Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Jerry and Debbie, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Randy and Courtney, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Marc and Kendra, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Larry and Sherri, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Chris and Jenna, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Gerry, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Matthew and Matt, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Doug and Paula, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Jon and Lynsay, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Friends at Grace Bible Church, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Matt and Amy, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Nick and Laura, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Jimmie and Kristin, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Cliff and Katie, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Dave and Kara, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  



	
	

 
 
	
	

	

Funtkova ulica 32 | 1000 Ljubljana, Slovenia | Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org | Niki.Shirkman@cru.org | 330-608-9756	
	

Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Steve and Stacy, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Chris and Morgan, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Alex and Erica, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  



	
	

 
 
	
	

	

Funtkova ulica 32 | 1000 Ljubljana, Slovenia | Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org | Niki.Shirkman@cru.org | 330-608-9756	
	

Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Dan and Casey, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Kimmy, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Dustin, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Ryan and Karen, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Brian and Colleen, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Bryce and Krista, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Tammy, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  



	
	

 
 
	
	

	

Funtkova ulica 32 | 1000 Ljubljana, Slovenia | Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org | Niki.Shirkman@cru.org | 330-608-9756	
	

Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Jack and Vickie, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Tom and Jolie, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Daniel and Ashley, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Daniel and Lindsey, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Scott and Emily, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Doug and Karla, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Dennis and Sandi, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  



	
	

 
 
	
	

	

Funtkova ulica 32 | 1000 Ljubljana, Slovenia | Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org | Niki.Shirkman@cru.org | 330-608-9756	
	

Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Rick and Amy, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Sam, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Matt, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Eric and Sarah, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Tyler and Jess, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Brian, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Chuck and Suzie, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  



	
	

 
 
	
	

	

Funtkova ulica 32 | 1000 Ljubljana, Slovenia | Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org | Niki.Shirkman@cru.org | 330-608-9756	
	

Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Zac and Katelynn, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Barry, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Justin and Erin, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Sean and Angela, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Josh and Janelle, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Bryan and Michelle, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Jack and Deb, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Jeff and Jennifer, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Wayne and Kim, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Ray, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Roger and Sharon, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Larry and Joyce, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Jon and Heidi, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Ron and LeAnn, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  



	
	

 
 
	
	

	

Funtkova ulica 32 | 1000 Ljubljana, Slovenia | Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org | Niki.Shirkman@cru.org | 330-608-9756	
	

Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Noah and Stephanie, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Jeff, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Randy and Nancy, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Norman and Rachael, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Kevin and Mary, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Michael and Rebecca, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Bob and Kaitlin, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear John and Kathy, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Michael and Chris, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Billy and Laura, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Jock and Caitlin, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Gari and Darlene, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Dave and Rachel, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Ma, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Pops and Pat, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Jon and Daniella, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Greg and Marie, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Jordan and Emily, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Kurt and Debbie, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Jordan and Courtney, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Greg and Jane, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Spence and Jenny, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Reggie and Jennette, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Sam, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Chuck and Terri, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Tracy and Nancy, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Matt and Cathy, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Mr. and Mrs. T, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Grandpa and Gaga, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  



	
	

 
 
	
	

	

Funtkova ulica 32 | 1000 Ljubljana, Slovenia | Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org | Niki.Shirkman@cru.org | 330-608-9756	
	

Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Rusty and Sherry, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Scott and Chelsea, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  



	
	

 
 
	
	

	

Funtkova ulica 32 | 1000 Ljubljana, Slovenia | Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org | Niki.Shirkman@cru.org | 330-608-9756	
	

Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Drew and Lauren, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Gary and Lauren, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Jessica, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Caleb, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Chip and Debbie, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Jim and Nancy, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Matt and Emily, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Kelby and Nicole, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Matt and Abby, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Ashley, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  



	
	

 
 
	
	

	

Funtkova ulica 32 | 1000 Ljubljana, Slovenia | Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org | Niki.Shirkman@cru.org | 330-608-9756	
	

Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Pastor Brenda, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Jacob and Jessica, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  
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Jordan and Niki Shirkman 
Reaching and equipping Slovenes for Jesus 

November 24, 2023 
 
Dear Marilyn, 

 
“That’s when I started believing that God must exist,” Grega shared with me (Jordan) as he described 
how he survived an incredibly trying season full of heartbreak and depression. Despite lacking any 
religious background, Grega appears to be growing more and more open to God.  
 
During one of our conversations, Grega told me, “I’ve learned a lot from the Greek philosophy of 
Stoicism. But I feel like I can’t keep sacrificing and make it on my own. I need God so I can give him my 
burdens.” I shared with him what the Bible says in 1 Peter 5:7, “Cast all your anxiety on him because he 
cares for you,” and I explained how God is ready and willing to take our sins and burdens from us. At the 
end of our time together, I asked Grega how I could pray for him and if I could pray with him right there. 
He agreed and thanked me after I prayed.  
 
A few days later, Grega messaged me and said, “No one has ever prayed for me before like you did, so I 
didn’t really know what to do. But I felt like someone cares. Although I’m not much of a religious person, I 
still felt something.” I responded to Grega and told him that what he was feeling was God’s love for him 
and Jesus coming near to him. I shared with him that the Lord often uses other people in our lives to 
show us his love. 
 
We consider it a privilege and an honor to join God in his work as he draws people like Grega to himself 
across Slovenia. We’re trusting the Lord for $10,000 in year-end gifts to keep reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
Your year-end gift would help us stay fully focused on God’s work in Slovenia by helping cover necessary 
ministry expenses and increased living costs. Would you consider giving a year-end gift of $1,000, 
$500, $100 or some other amount to help meet our need? You can give by mailing a check made out to 
“Cru” in the enclosed envelope along with the response card, or you can do so securely online at 
https://give.cru.org/0642948. If you’d like to give a non-cash gift in the form of a tax-deductible stock 
donation, please reach out by email to Jordan.Shirkman@cru.org. 
 
We thank the Lord for you, your prayers, and your partnership with us in reaching Slovenes for Christ. 
God is moving in incredible ways across Slovenia. We’re so grateful to seek Jesus together with you. We 
trust however the Lord leads you to respond, and we pray that you know what a blessing you are to us. 
May the Lord continue to remind you of his tremendous love, especially this Christmas season.   

 

In Christ,  



Name:  ____________________________________________________________________________ 

Yes, I/we would like to invest an additional year-end gift in your ministry to enable you to continue 
reaching and equipping Slovenes for Christ in 2024. 

I/we have enclosed a check made payable to Cru. 

I/we will give a special gift of $___________ online at https://give.cru.org/0642948. 

Prayer Requests:_____________________________________________________________________________ 

______________________________________________________________________________________________

______________________________________________________________________________________________


